BURKE COUNTY BOARD OF COMMISSIONERS
FINANCE COMMITTEE

October 13, 2017
The Finance Committee of the Burke County Board of Commissioners met on Friday, October 13, 2017 at 3:30 p.m. at the Commissioners Conference Room. The meeting was called to order by Committee Chairman Lucious Abrams.  Others present were Commissioners George Deloach and Evans Martin. County Administrator, Merv Waldrop was also in attendance.
The Committee reviewed the bids on paper products and trash can liners.  The bids were opened on Tuesday and reviewed by the Facility Maintenance Director.  They are listed below:
	Bidder
	 Haskins 
	 Kamo 
	 Associated Paper 
	 S&S 
	 AVM 
	 Central Poly 
	American Pride Paper & Plastics 

	Brands
	 Augusta, GA 
	 Augusta, GA 
	 Augusta, GA 
	 North Augusta, SC 
	 Ooltewah, TN 
	 Linden, NJ 
	Lakewood, NJ 

	 
	 
	 
	 
	 
	 
	 
	 

	singlefold paper towels
	
	
	
	
	
	

	Stefco
	 
	 
	 
	 
	 
	 
	 

	Bay West 47000
	$14.38 
	 
	 
	 
	$23.36 
	 
	 

	Nibroc
	 
	 
	 
	 
	 
	 
	 

	Boardwalk
	 
	 
	 
	$13.65 
	$21.50 
	 
	 

	Georgia Pacific
	 
	$13.76 
	 
	$38.75 
	$31.10 
	 
	 

	 
	 
	 
	$13.70 
	 
	 
	 
	 

	 
	 
	 
	 
	 
	 
	*13.89
	*11.46

	multi-fold paper towels
	natural brown
	 
	 
	 
	 
	 

	Stefco
	 
	 
	 
	 
	 
	 
	 

	Bay West 48000
	 
	 
	 
	 
	$23.35 
	 
	 

	Georgia Pacific
	$13.88 
	$13.13 
	 
	$37.90 
	$29.55 
	 
	 

	Nibroc
	 
	 
	 
	 
	 
	 
	 

	Boardwalk
	 
	 
	 
	$13.20 
	$20.50 
	 
	 

	ProLink
	$13.23 
	 
	 
	 
	 
	 
	 

	 
	 
	 
	*13.00
	 
	$19.65 
	*13.35
	*11.29

	multi-fold paper towels
	bleached white
	 
	 
	 
	 
	 

	Stefco
	 
	 
	 
	 
	 
	 
	 

	Georgia Pacific
	 
	$15.98 
	 
	$42.80 
	$35.10 
	 
	 

	Advantage
	 
	 
	 
	 
	 
	 
	 

	Bay West 48500
	$16.56 
	 
	 
	 
	$26.30 
	 
	 

	Boardwalk
	 
	 
	 
	$15.90 
	$23.62 
	 
	 

	Nibroc
	 
	 
	 
	 
	 
	 
	 

	ProLink
	$15.89 
	 
	 
	 
	 
	 
	 

	 
	 
	 
	*15.89
	 
	 
	*16.12
	*12.46

	household roll towels
	 
	 
	 
	 
	 
	 

	Bay West
	$18.12 
	 
	 
	 
	$28.65 
	 
	 

	Boardwalk
	 
	 
	 
	$23.00 
	$25.88 
	 
	 

	Georgia Pacific
	 
	$17.24 
	 
	$58.90 
	 
	 
	 

	Stefco
	 
	 
	 
	 
	 
	 
	 

	Kimberly Clark
	 
	 
	 
	 
	 
	 
	 

	ProLink
	$18.00 
	 
	 
	 
	 
	 
	 

	 
	 
	 
	*15.5
	 
	 
	*17.5
	no bid

	roll toilet tissue
	 
	 
	 
	 
	 
	 

	Kimberly Clark
	 
	 
	 
	 
	$78.05 
	 
	 

	Bay West 54900
	$34.45 
	 
	 
	 
	 
	 
	 

	Paper Source
	 
	$29.13 
	 
	$34.00 
	$34.41 
	 
	 

	ProLink
	$29.95 
	 
	 
	 
	 
	 
	 

	Boardwalk
	 
	 
	$28.75 
	 
	$34.41 
	 
	 

	 
	 
	 
	 
	 
	 
	*30
	*28.74

	Jr. Jumbo Roll Tissue
	White 2ply / 9in.
	 
	 
	 
	 
	 

	Acme (ABJRT9)
	 
	 
	 
	 
	 
	 
	 

	ProLink
	 
	 
	 
	 
	 
	 
	 

	Bay West 10020
	 
	 
	 
	 
	$39.05 
	 
	 

	Morcon (Mor29)
	 
	$18.64 
	$15.50 
	$15.90 
	$17.88 
	 
	 

	ProLink
	$22.45 
	 
	 
	 
	 
	 
	 

	 
	*23.12
	 
	 
	 
	 
	*14.8
	*13.98

	hard wound roll towels
	White 2 ply
	 
	 
	 
	 
	 

	Stefco
	 
	 
	 
	$29.50 
	 
	 
	 

	Bay West 45500
	$21.38 
	 
	 
	 
	$39.65 
	 
	 

	Prime Source
	 
	$18.46 
	 
	 
	 
	 
	 

	Boardwalk
	 
	 
	 
	$19.20 
	$24.40 
	 
	 

	 
	 
	 
	*19.4
	 
	 
	*18.67
	*14.49

	trash can liners
	 
	 
	 
	 
	 
	 

	10-12 gallon
	$22.52 
	$19.96 
	$23.89 
	$22.90 
	$16.79 
	$15.30 
	no bid

	30 gallon
	$21.90 
	$20.40 
	$22.28 
	$20.90 
	$19.11 
	$19.80 
	no bid

	55-60 gallon
	$23.66 
	$22.06 
	$24.10 
	$25.90 
	$20.54 
	$19.90 
	no bid

	45 gallon
	$25.10 
	$22.89 
	$25.00 
	$22.50 
	$21.62 
	$24.10 
	no bid

	33 gallon
	$17.15 
	$16.89 
	$17.95 
	$19.25 
	$14.86 
	$15.40 
	no bid

	extra hvy leaf bag
	$23.95 
	$20.39 
	$20.35 
	$21.15 
	$19.81 
	$19.00 
	no bid

	10-12 gal low density
	$16.75 
	$15.22 
	$15.25 
	$15.50 
	$15.85 
	$14.80 
	no bid


AVM was the low bidder on the most items that the County uses frequently.  However, the Committee was concerned if they could service our account from a Tennessee location.  KAMO was the lowest bidder on the next number of items that we use.  Mr. Martin moved to award the bid to KAMO.  Mr. Deloach gave the second.  The motion carried 3 to 0.  
Next the Committee reviewed the bid for the rumble strip project.  There was only one bidder, Reeves Construction at $149,625.  The Administrator reported that the Road Department was satisfied that Reeves meets all the specs.  Mr. Martin then made a motion to award the project to Reeves Construction.  Mr. Deloach seconded the motion and it passed unanimously.
After that the Committee considered approval of a purchase order for Wade Ford for a new police pursuit vehicle for the Sheriff’s Office.  The purchase is based on a bid from September.  Wade Ford has agreed to hold the price.  They were the low bid on pursuit sedan.  Mr. Deloach moved to issue a purchase order to Wade Ford for a new police vehicle at $25,142.   Mr. Martin made the second.  The motion was approved with all three in favor.

The Committee then considered a budget amendment for the Clerk of Courts.  The Clerk had funds in last year’s budget for a new computer.  The computer didn’t get ordered in time to make fy 17.  In order to allow the purchase for the computer that was approved for the last year, the Administrator explained that we need to recognize the amount of the computer as balance forward and then appropriate it for the computer.  Mr. Martin moved to approve the budget amendment for the computer for the Clerk of Courts.  Mr. Deloach seconded the motion.  It passed 3 to 0.  

After that the Committee reviewed the bills for the month of September.  There were a few questions concerning the towing for county vehicles.  All invoices were approved for payment.

There being no further business the meeting was adjourned at 4:37 p.m.
_____________________________


______________________________

Lucious Abrams, Jr., Chairman


George Deloach, Commissioner

______________________________

______________________________

Evans Martin, Commissioner 



Merv Waldrop, Administrator

